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 Agenda No. 8 

 

www.communityenterprisespl12.co.uk                   4 Fore Street, Saltash PL12 6JL 
 

Report to Saltash Town Council: August 2 2018 
 
 
Our established enterprises continue to operate well, with good community responses to 
Hopper bus services, dementia groups, and our Hub and its markets. 18 Belle Vue Road 
is still progressing well after over two and a half years of our management.  
 
We have recently taken on a part-time member of staff at the Hub to provide more 
continuity of cover in response to increased public contact.  
 

AGM 
Directors have decided that the AGM will be held this year on Wednesday September 
26 at 7pm. Venue tbc. It will provide a great opportunity for councillors and public to hear 
a summary of our work in the last year, and to reflect on future prospects. Our Annual 
Accounts will be presented. Please put this in your diaries: we would be delighted to have 
your presence. 
 
Very importantly, we hope to appoint four new Directors then. This represents a one third 
change in personnel, which is significant in terms of our future. We have some interest 
already but I am willing to speak informally to anyone who feels they would like to 
contribute to our governance as a company or to help run our Enterprises.  
 
Scrapstore   
Against the odds, we have actually found premises in Fore Street by doing a deal to take 
up the last 9 months of the unexpired lease of the vacant Field Leisure shop (the project 
would not be financially viable under a normal commercial tenancy). We therefore see 
this opportunity as a way of testing out the project before making a final decision on it. 
The location should be a great advantage in establishing the Enterprise and building a 
network of contributors and customers. 
 
We are currently building the partnership team to run it and drawing down the s106 
funding. There will have to be some financial adjustments due to the changed venue 
which will result in increased set-up costs and outgoings. I hope to be able to provide full 
details of the new Enterprise for the next meeting. 
 
Health and Social Care 

http://www.communityenterprisespl12.co.uk/
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We continue to support the engagement of patients in NHS issues, and the two Patient 
Groups in the town are proving very resilient. Following a recent meeting of patients from 
both practices with the strategic manager of NHS Kernow (East) two projects will be 
coming soon to the town: one aimed at reducing waste through over-prescribing of 
medicines; and the other promoting community support alongside more conventional 
medical care, called “social prescribing”.  
 
Whilst this is encouraging, we are still unable to get a response to requests for further 
engagement on the future of services that were withdrawn from St Barnabas Hospital 
more than 18 months ago.  
 
 
Peter Thistlethwaite 

Chair 
July 28 2018 
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Agenda No. 27 

To be noted by members. 
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